
Reisling
Central Coast
Pale yellow in color with scents of flowers, 
pear and stone fruit. Medium-bodied and 
elegant with green apple, stone fruit and 
mineral flavors finishing with a touch of 
sweetness and lingering fruit flavors.

Food recommendations
This is a great sipping wine and goes well with 
many foods, especially Asian and Indian 
cuisine, salads, grilled meats and smoked fish.

Tarrica Wine Cellars Central Coast Riesling 
was fermented slowly at low temperatures, in 
100% stainless steel tanks to ensure both the 
fruit and freshness of this wine.

Reisling
Central Coast
Pale yellow in color with scents of flowers, 
pear and stone fruit. Medium-bodied and 
elegant with green apple, stone fruit and 
mineral flavors finishing with a touch of 
sweetness and lingering fruit flavors.

Food recommendations
This is a great sipping wine and goes well with 
many foods, especially Asian and Indian 
cuisine, salads, grilled meats and smoked fish.

Tarrica Wine Cellars Central Coast Riesling 
was fermented slowly at low temperatures, in 
100% stainless steel tanks to ensure both the 
fruit and freshness of this wine.

Reisling
Central Coast
Pale yellow in color with scents of flowers, 
pear and stone fruit. Medium-bodied and 
elegant with green apple, stone fruit and 
mineral flavors finishing with a touch of 
sweetness and lingering fruit flavors.

Food recommendations
This is a great sipping wine and goes well with 
many foods, especially Asian and Indian 
cuisine, salads, grilled meats and smoked fish.

Tarrica Wine Cellars Central Coast Riesling 
was fermented slowly at low temperatures, in 
100% stainless steel tanks to ensure both the 
fruit and freshness of this wine.


